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Ostasiuk Z., Kotsiurba B. Essence and Structure of Instrumental-Performing

Competence of Future Specialists of Musical Art
The article is devoted to the problem of determining the essence and structure of in-

strumental and performing skills. The authors have analyzed the statements regarding the
definition of the essence of the concept of instrumental-performing competence and its com-
ponents such as: musical component, musical-grammatical, musical-performing and musical-
pedagogical competence. It is substantiated based on the conclusions of researchers that
competence primarily reveals the ability of a specialist to carry out the necessary profes-
sional actions, to successfully implement acquired knowledge, skills and abilities in practice.
The instrumental-performing competence is defined as a complex integrative personal quality
of the future teacher of musical art, the formation of which is due to theartistic interpretation
ability in various types of instrumental-performing activities. It is highlighted that the per-
forming activity is one of the types of professional and pedagogical activity of the future
teacher of musical art and is characterized as multidimensional, unique by the nature of im-
plementation and result, original, socio-historical and individual.

The authors have traced the professional competence development process, which is
determined by the peculiarities of multilevel, polystructural and multidimensional musical
performance, which is connected with the process of artistic perception, knowledge and com-
prehension of the individual and creative interpretation of a musical piece.

The research allowed to conclude that professional growth is characterized by the de-
sire to achieve specific goals both in educational and professional activities through the use
of musical-auditory, musical-grammatical, musical-performing and musical-pedagogical
competencies. Their existence demonstrates the readiness of the future teacher of musical art
to pedagogical activity, provides a high level of self-organization, raises personal responsi-
bility for the quality of upbringing of the younger generation, and should be directed at the
revival of national culture, the development of artistic traditions, and the effective popular
participation in active artistic and creative activity.
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