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Marchenko O. The Cadets’ Adaptation of to Conditions of Educational 
Environment of Higher Military Educational Instituions

The urgency of the problem of adaptation of students to the educational environment 
conditions of the higher military educational institutions. In the educational environment of 
higher military educational institution cadets is all vital functions: education, extracurricular 
activities, leisure, implemented formal role and interpersonal relationships. Refined essence 
of the concepts of “environment”, “adaptation” in the biological, psychological, 
philosophical, social, pedagogical aspects. Category “environment” is an interdisciplinary 
concept. Determining its nature depends on the specific subject of scientific field research. 
Educational environment higher military educational institutions as a means of learning and 
aggregate social and material conditions directly and indirectly affects the personality of a 
cadet in the military and professional education. The development of the adaptation process 
aims to achieve homeostasis as a state of dynamic equilibrium of internal and external system 
elements. Determined cadets adaptation stages to the educational environment of higher 
military institutions: estimated, unstable device, a relatively stable device. According to 
observations of students adapting to new learning environments in higher military 
educational institution is most intense during the first year. Noticed that the end of the first 
semester students of deteriorating health, reduced activity, but in the second semester are 
normalized. It is alleged that the preliminary military training (in secondary boarding schools 
with initial military training) should psycho-pedagogical support to facilitate the adaptation 
of cadets of educational environment of higher military educational institution.

Key words: adaptation, environment condition, the stage, the educational 
environment, higher military school cadet, officer, teacher.
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