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Lando O. The Application of Healthcare Technology in the Educational Process 
in a Teacher’s Training College

The article deals with the problem of application of healthcare technology in the educa-
tional process at a teacher’s training college. Different approaches towards definition of the 
term “healthcare competence” are studied. The ways of using the technology in the educational 
process as a means of formation the healthcare competence of future primary school teachers 
are disclosed. The article researches the latest achievements in the field of healthcare compe-
tence. The main factors of formation health care competence are determined. The importance of 
implementation the competence approach and orientation towards the formation of key compe-
tences is emphasized. Healthcare competence, thus, is regarded as one of the key competences. 
The author of the article stresses the importance of incorporation of this key competence in all 
school subjects. Various factors that should be taken into consideration during formation of 
healthcare competence are analyzed. The process of formation of healthy lifestyle approach can 
include several stages. The first stage is evaluative and implies the identification of students’ 
interests. The second stage implies the active physical development of a student and maintain-
ing these skills. The third stage is aimed at improvement of gained skills. Thus, successful pro-
fessional activity and health condition of future primary school teachers are regarded as a sin-
gle process. The article deals with different classifications of healthcare approaches from the 
viewpoint of several criteria. Different forms of work that can be applied in the process of for-
mation the healthcare competence are analyzed. The main priorities in formation the healthcare 
competence are stressed. A future teacher can be considered as one having a formed healthcare 
competence in case he realizes it as an integral part of an educational process. 
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